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(Contract Management Use only)
CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM
CONTRACT
TRACKING NO. |
CONTRACTOR INFORMATION _ CM2644 )
Name: Ricoh/Copyfax |
Al 8475 Western Way, Suite 100 Jacksonville FL 32256 ‘
City State Zip '
Contractor's Administrator Name: uchard Durant Title; |
Tew.  (904)296-1600 . (904)296-7111 . richard.durant@copyfax.com |
CONTRACT INFORMATION ;
Contract Name: ~€@S€/Maintenance and Supply Agreement Contract Value: 90+950.88 |
L . Lease and Maintenance and Supply Agreement for MPC4504EX at Yulee Yard; US Communities 4400003732 "
Brief Description: _

Contract Dates : From: Mw; _Llﬁ_&_&_\_ Status: X New Renew Amend# __ WA/Task Order

How Procured: ___ Sole Source ___ SingleSource ___ITB ___RFP __ RFQ & Coop. __ Other

If Processing an Amendment: ‘

Contract #: Increase Amount of Existing Contract:
New Contract Dates: TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT:
—_— ) 4
ALS PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6
72-03-% Road and Bridge

partment Head Signature Date

gz ,‘;@ 5“§? artmen: g,: \

2.
Funding Source/Acct # m Se
; 2l |
eny & Budgét / /e %
v / '
4 / [ Jou//f Plose 04 Lading |
/ oufity Attorney (ayye?// ato forfn only) / [Date O |
Comments € "
: F o Y ::‘
~FIN SIGNATURE + 4 DEC 18 bua: 25
LA L
/4 |
aeﬁ/ Mullin { / / £, D te ]
RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: ‘ '
Original: Clerk’s Services; Contractor (original or certified copy)
Copy: Department
Office of Management & Budget
Contract Management

Clerk Finance

Revised 4/05/2017



COPY FA X«é

OCTOBER 130, 2018 i

PROPOSAL ‘

FOR g
NASSAU COUNTY @
ROAD & BRIDGE il
|
RICOH MPCA4504EX COLOR COPIER $ 12144
PB33240 PAPER FEED UNIT 16.13
SR3210 FINISHER-STAPLER 20.73 ;
BU3070 BRIDGE UNIT 2.15 ,
PU3050 PUNCH UNIT 929
FAX OPTION M20 13.34 !
]

FEATURES: 45 PRINTS PER MINUTE
SCAN-PRINT-COPY-FAX
SORT-STAPLE-PUNCH

36 MONTH LEASE AT $183.08 PER MONTH

U S COMMUNITIES 4400003732

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT

TO INCLUDE ALL PARTS, LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND
SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES. MONOCHROME
PRINTS AT $.0059 PER PRINT. COLOR PRINTS AT $.045 PER

e

COLOR PRINT. |
{

Jacksonville e Gainesville exe Daytona Beach s
3475 Westem Way as-n.nmm- 480 Farnres B §
]
R 52288 Gaineswifa, Fl. 31809 Daytans Besch, :
Fhore: 9042961600 e i s

Fox SOLZSET 111

RICOH WWW.COPYFAX.COM @R
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Solutions

BY SUPPLIER ( show ol )

BY CATEGORY
Facilities
Office & School

Spedialty
Technology

Main Menu

JUMP TO:

Solicttations

About

News & Events
Resources

Contact Us

Education Purchasing
Government Purchasing
Nonprofit

© GaGreenProgram

Ricoh Contract | U.S. Communities

About News & Events Resources Contact Us

PRODUCTS & SOLUTIONS CONTRACT DOCUMENTS REGISTER LOGH

Ricoh Contract

Home > Ricoh > Ricoh Contract
Multifunction Devices/Managed Print Services

Cantract Documents:
Lead W Contract Number 4400003732
Fairfax County, Virginia

Notice of Award

Contract Number: Contract Amendments
4400003732 Master Lease Agreement

Equipment Sale and Maintenance
3 year, 5 month initial term, February 11, 2013 - June 30, 2016 Agreement
QOptlon to renew for (6) additional (1) year periods or any combination thereof
The contract Is renewed for three (3) years, effective july 1, 2016 through

June 30, 2019
RFP Documents:
&c e RFP 2000000264
on
- BEL S Atachment A
Amendment 7 added to Contract Amendments on August 15, 2017
Attachment A t
REQUEST INFORMATION SR
™ Attachment C
2000000264 Addenda
RFP Posting Document

Postings

No, of suppliers who responded to RFP: 3
Pasting Information: Date Posted:
U.S. Communities: Current Solicitations May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012
Canadian MERX Public Tenders May 11, 2012 to june 19, 2012
Onvia Demand Star May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012
Fairfax County May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012
Assoclation of Oregon Counties May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012
State of Hawail and Oregon May 11, 2012 to June 19, 2012

Getting Started

Why Usa U.S. Communities Discounts on Brands Over 55,000 agencles trust U.S.

o Bracram Ousndaw

s What Makec ke Niffarant o Pradicre R Srrndines ® Wha tikac il § Fammunitiac

By clicking accept, you indicate that you have read and understand ourTerms of Use

Accapt

https:/Awww,uscommunities.org/suppliers/ricohfricoh-contract/ 12




- 11/29/2018 Ricoh Contract | U.S. Communities
CONTACTUS BECOME A SUPPLIER ABOUT US TERMS OF USE PRIVACY MICPA

© 2018 U.8. Communities | All Rights Reserved.

By cicking accept, you indicate that you have read and understand ourTerms of Use

Accept
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: George Aviles

From: George Aviles

Sent: Thursday, December 13, 2018 1:39 PM

To: Grayson Hagins

Cc: Becky Bray; Shelley Caldwell (scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com); Cameron Hansen; Jennifer
Kirkland; Norma Jean Angeles (njangeles@nassaucountyfl.com)

Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Attachments: 20181203073903487.pdf; 20181203073913571.pdf

Good Afternoon Grayson,
See below on 12-03-18, | answered funding questions about these two contracts (Attachments) to Shelley?

George Aviles Jr., Office Manager
Nassau County Road & Bridge Dept Florida

| put those in an interoffice envelope to Road and Bridge on 11/29. I'm somehow guessing those weren’t received?...

Grayson Hagins

Contract/Purchasing Manager

Nassau County Board of County Commissioners
96135 Nassau Place, Suite 6

Yulee, FL 32097

ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com

(904) 530-6040

From: Jennifer Kirkland

Sent: Thursday, December 13, 2018 1:33 PM

To: George Aviles <gaviles@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Is this what you are looking for?

Jennifer Kirkland
904.530.6180

From: George Aviles

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 8:17 AM

To: Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Becky Bray <bbray@nassaucountyfl.com>; Cameron Hansen <chansen@nassaucountyfl.com>; Jennifer Kirkland
<jkirkland@nassaucountyfl.com>; Brandi Jordan <bjordan@nassaucountyfl.com>; Norma Jean Angeles
<njangeles@nassaucountyfl.com>

Subject: FW: 2 Contracts

Good Morning Ma’am,

The funding code for CM2643 & CM2644



are the same, Accounts 03400541-544000
& 03400541-546020.

George Aviles Jr., Office Manager
Nassau County Road & Bridge Dept Florida

From: Norma Jean Angeles

Sent: Monday, December 03, 2018 7:48 AM

To: George Aviles <gaviles@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: 2 Contracts

Good morning George,

In your scan folder, see attached two (2) contracts as noted per Shelley.

Thank you.

Norma-Jean C. Angeles

Road and Bridge Fleet Management
96161 Nassau Place

Yulee, FL 32097

Phone (904) 530-6178

Email: NJAngeles@nassaucountyfl.com

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in

writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in

writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in response to a
public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone orin

writing.
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